
-),Owdm? o;,rv44Aq



CLAIRE MCLAN E
RESIDENTIAL CON CE PTS

4405 WALSH STREET • CHEVY CHASE, MD 20815
t 301 654 • 2820 f 301 654 • 5262 c 301 404 , 2820

clairemclane@aol.com



Staff Item #2—Anne Fothergill
September 9, 2009

7391 Buffalo Avenue, Takoma Park
Non-Contributing Resource

The HPC approved alterations at the rear of this house including a ground level screened porch and a

deck off the first floor. The applicants are now requesting minor changes and staff is requesting that the

HPC allow these changes to be approved at the staff level.



LANDTECH ASSOCIATES, INC.
10260 OLD COLUMBIA ROAD SUITE J

COLUMBIA, MARYLAND 21046-1721 .

PHONE: 410-290-8099 TOLL FREE: BBB-290-
1920

FAX: 410-290-6299 TOLL FREE BBB
-290-1922

~~c~tea
a~a

Re~1oea

X

X

j CO

w N

Q S760 q

.,,t,.nd
0 tO dri a 

f
LL
LL. 1`5s.a p

m f 4 2 
story W

tp frame

S8318'
30"W

76
Lot 31

424.189

Lot 30
8T" 3q. Ft.
(record plat)

Part of Lot 7

224.18





1p".agull gill all-w— 1111,11 ML Nil

X11!

w~1GrcN' trlu~~j acuc_
(o~.ti~Nky voce ~- 14'Q)

vw—

ANcon
-two
(IRC au

eoew.

DAn
f7At
FLa
SCA



rj ---- ,- _ -

designs depkled may riot
in any manner vdmout the I
and eVress pefmft n of C

REVISED iZ

All consh action Shag he in IX
w/4 . national Rasldadid C
(IRC 7003) and ON ~ app'
prevait0 nI . and/or to
coder, per #w Mebdle0an d

DATE:-----~~--
PLAN:
FLOOR
SCALE: Y. - 1'0



AW 4mi4jo 9Ou* *fAv*

zoos
CLA .LANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4105 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase. MD 20815
301.654.2820 of 301.404.28'10 c

11

, 1

4oy Vow—

1 COLAr% 1tuL 
These auww gs may not be c
de$19M depicted may not be usec
in any manner wiprout the krtowledg-
and express permission 01 Claire MCLC

REVISED 1 y 74*

nn constrvction MW be In accordance
w/MNmalbnd bafderAd Code 200$
(IRC 2003) and all ~ opiskaMe osd
pre' alb lb nollond orWor local MsMdMq
codes, per Ilse M bel"m+ d Mb sfte.



lif.) !may Pou,Nt' ~MIMtk
301.401.2640 c

(A^11 ~DJS i
These dam may not be copied, and
"ns depicted may not be used .
in any njonner vA#W the knovAec ge
and express WNW- of Ck Ne McLane.

A-- '✓h°tip°

:; arum L°I'IvA

_ Iwo Nff(64'W

Tr 
—~

a

6--of a"
rfq Dt~ AlL9

y o ~ 7wlw(y

'~ 10 '/~ ~ 
aor

YL0

REVISED 1`2 7*4,

AN construction sha0 be in accordance
+v/hdaeallonol Iasida 0 Cody 7003
)IRC 7003) and of olhsn applicable and
pravalliprssdlondand/or local' 10
coda. Odr Ile kabdie0on of this sle.

DATE:
PLAN: AK IO✓KOI~
FLOOR:
vuc-+r.•.rn -



Ar16. ?AA

LANDTECN A&BOCIATE9_ INC_
1096U YLO wwMNIAOOAD Cora J
OOLL•MMIA. MAWLr MO I1 O.C.11.1'

CMONC: A1P V WUVO TOLL I.CC'C ON- .90.. V 40
rA%: 414291 999 TOLL rREc a00-iC0-ILLY

N

870.4V'TS 
Laaa\ 

76

0 
4.

a T8\
" gY

< 

* Lot 30
m  

7 T1M \

1 Y ww.wM1

224-78
Sf 

w aLmT

FA

Locadon Survey of..; LOT: 
,~., 

BLOCK: 78

97981BuftIDAwam [PLATBK: a 1 PLATP: 839

Dls..r'• DATE: 1-22-W SCALE:

N
bbaLT1.1® er 

CA8E NUMBER: 080002Taka®a Park _
Dry Co., MD ii NUMBER:. LT-2080072of

~~ ~ LTYW Mrr~lO.wMlrlerry b.anygblVOO.iMVYYOrr1

iblCYa ~aY1YbT~0 .M.6VM+~1.sq
absr+.ol.rsraa.or.»sq.mar....rb+uwsrr

+aroeAMn..rYY,...
arrr.W.w amawrlrbY..a.mNm.w.1.YLe..c~=arM
LW gmauMa m...NrI W s=+na..•IMNwM.wq
L•g461 Wlnw.rm.ra».maYP W 4wnY0YpeMYq..V.

. `~ l.awr..11ne.¢"s.W✓+M.MeaW wgVUM.wi1M•1.i MYa
L r..obsmearla.....nTseric smaMln.

1.1~'~.~'.m:r::.a•M'~w.r.~j°'awsw:~aora~..11.~~m

r.LryMMM
CWrCMM W »nt
II.W:q<

.Y~aMMnaTpm WOp en
ArT MkYry.M NwN
ay ~eNiNaq N.p.ml
eawwnX/rYn. W CMs.W +e.

H
Stir»d 

a~eMppmLeW bbMevym Daf
z colrlld~r.la.wwaaarnmeartromm=:..wr^on~cn
S IbwfrLVDrYIbY1O
.1. n..Lw.1. b.mroaodmdd Ca. wrn

pp
R1`

V

WI7~~vV's-/

n.M:weT.
Dlgeu4ra0(»~wy.•.
~~ 

~ 

.. y

na.aLL~r1Ma..yrw MY•c maraaaW=.d.
.b1ww.'ManY++V....
/YMIw1vMWmws

Oaae00a~~M1~~o~



PH,

Y



maw

a~cy,m4

' .+....._ .v .,
sg14'.{'itw.ribw.a4N'd) awbYaomumoY6w

L~1N/M.i[Y a~Yp.wy7lpgM Mar; .
Ygie,aya,YaOlalW,I
T1,9il~Ytl.lQ1+Y[lua

II

Y,

f.+l5llrw-~ _3f.

Ff~• s̀ FwiM1:!

rN• M.ttf .. __.

'~ vu

- ~.IY► Nw ,.f. fuKela wnq 141

'_-_'_"_. .I•~ 
~S 

rl y,t~.l~,.- 
~_~. 

~~, ~IkI.S ~ ..,...._ 
tP.c~.A

Wilk

' NIIV 0146 W" a{IfI1i. .ICPYfI(~,.~.4

P%4:44

All

r

~ NiYt Wt. MG fAnj 4 hH M' 1b.4+54Mt-
I MJPIR~ I

{bgang0ooiy I

3:NG W~IW 5M` '



• .tom r~ _
"' •'~.I~~w.w~Pw if KYx w.. Gfq —~ - Iw • s ,s jbug

sit

...--
MINYawIM~~~h r• I _-`~NMQD~.C!'Ms.~415-,
1e :ly

' _LMNN08 R•*k' N:l: '

i

~VKP }11.•( .ar+rrr+ars
IM~:GPcaYww.:'Lx:bU ERB- `sw1A

1%►Jroar~

tCML'Y•n10  
9'.i d,



HISTORIC PRESERVATION COMMISSION
Isiah Leggett Jef Fuller

County Executive Chairperson

Date: 03/28/08

MEMORANDUM

TO: Carla Reid, Director
Department of Permitting Services

FROM: Anne Fothergill
Planner Coordina
Historic Preservation Section-Planning Department
Maryland-National Capital Park & Planning Commission

SUBJECT: Historic Area Work Permit #479312 - Deck and stairs, screened porch, and basement window

The Montgomery County Historic Preservation Commission (HPC) has reviewed the attached application for a
Historic Area Work Permit (HAWP). This application was approved at the March 26, 2008 meeting.

THE BUILDING PERMIT FOR THIS PROJECT SHALL BE ISSUED CONDITIONAL UPON ADHERENCE

TO THE ABOVE APPROVED HAWP CONDITIONS AND MAY REQUIRE APPROVAL BY DPS OR
ANOTHER LOCAL OFFICE BEFORE WORK CAN BEGIN.

Applicant: Jeffrey Kohn
Address: 7391 Buffalo Avenue, Takoma Park

This HAWP approval is subject to the general condition that the applicant will obtain all other applicable
Montgomery County or local government agency permits. After the issuance of these permits, the applicant must
contact this Historic Preservation Office if any changes to the approved plan are made.

Historic Preservation Commission 91109 Spring Street, Suite 801 9 Silver Spring, MD 20910.301 /563-3400 •301 /563-3412 FAX



~ e RETURN_T0: UEPARTMEtd10fPEkN11TTINGSERVICES
255 ROCKVILLE PIKE. 2nd FLOOR. ROCy.VILLE. MD 211850
2d0'777-6370 D

~ 76 HISTORIC PRESERVATION• •

ID
301/563-3400

APPLICATION FOR
HISTORIC AREA WORK PERMIT

Contact Person: C ofur, A (,#4

xx 
j9~,k p!S

/
7~ '  Daytime Phone No.: 2 1/4 " 

•','/1
Tax Account No.: V (Q 

0f 
~ ~ -I
% 
~ ~ rc~ G'~✓* t%~ 1~ M tlo /LGb~ ~ JErr C'^

Name of Property Owner: ♦ r Daytime Phone No.: Z7-

Address:
— f ' Street Number City 

 

Steer Zip Code

Contractorr: ul~v .9 t"

Contractor Registration No.:

Agent for Owner: C & IL k ; JAL U-4~__ Daytime Phone No.:

LOCATION OF 

BUILDI-);)6

NG~/PRREMISE 

j~~1
House Number: 

/ 
1 ;) 

6~ 
~ 
[
k f -k1/ It vi_ Street fA)r ~l ~ 1/U ~ CKICt—

Town/City: ,/ 1`I~-R W4~ _ NearestCrossStreet:

Lot:  Block:_ Subdivision: - 1 PL- --(

Libor: Folio: Parcel:

P., lid T ONE; TYPE OF PERMIT ACTION AND USE

1A, CHECK ALL APPLICABLE: CHECK ALL APPLICABLE: 
440&

❑ Construct ❑ Extend _,ZAlter/Renovate ❑ A/C ❑ Slab ❑ Room Addition ❑ Porch ❑ Shed

❑ Move ❑ Install ❑ Wreck/Raze ❑ Solar ❑ Fireplace ❑ Woodbuming Stove ❑ SingleFaam
il

ily

❑ Revision ❑ Repair ❑ Revocable O Fence/Wall (complete Section 4) ,,%er. D

18. Construction cost estimate: $ ~ D bD~ ~d t7n) / ko ldont)
la I v s~a►p~° r1C. If this is a revision of a previously approved active permit, see Permit # ) 1"" 'i~'I't ~'~ISI•

~>zc~ 10 N&w

2A. Type of sewage disposal: OWSSC 02 ❑Septic 03 C Other

213. Type of water supply: 01 WSSC 02 ❑ Well 03 ❑ Other:

PARTTHREE: COMPLETE ONLY FOR FENCE/RETAINING WALL

3A. Height feet inches

36. Indicate whether the fence or retaining wall is to be constructed on one of the following locations

❑ On party line/property line ❑ Entirely on land of owner ❑ On public right of way/easement

I herebv certify that 1 have the authority to make the foregoing application, that the application is correct, and that the construction will comply with plans
approved by all agencies listed and I hereby acknowledge and accept this to be a condition for the issuance of this permit.

Signature' _ or authorized agent Date

Approved: For Chairperson, His" r Preservation Commission

Disapproved: Signature: 1' Date: !2 7- O

Application/Permit No.: 7  3 Z Date Filed: f— Date Issued:

Edit 6/21/99 SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR INSTRUCTIONS



THE FOLLOWING ITEMS MUST BE COMPLETED AND THE
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS MUST ACCOMPANY THIS APPLICATION.

1. WRITTEN DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT

a. Description of existing structure(s) and environmental s , includio their historical features and 

significance:G~ Qtl' 107t~o IOU L— 441 1 4-1VAZ s✓ f 1

AV ~'pTrN( AePK ~1f?fti2, PACr— —E'o ~ . -

b. General description of project and its effect on the historic resource(s), the environmental setting, and, where applicable, the historic district

2. SITE PLAN

Site and environmental setting, drawn to scale. You may use your plat. Your site plan must include:

a, the scale, north arrow, and date;

b. dimensions of all existing and proposed structures; and

c. site features such as walkways, driveways, fences, ponds, streams, trash dumpsters, mechanical equipment, and landscaping.

3. PLANS AND ELEVATIONS

You must submit 2 copies of clans and elevations in a format no larger than 11" x 17". Plans on 8 1/2" x 11" paper are preferred.

a. Schematic construction plans, with marked dimensions, indicating location, size and general type of walls, window and door openings, and other

fixed features of both the existing resources) and the proposed work.

b. Elevations (facades), with marked dimensions, clearly indicating proposed work in relation to existing construction and, when appropriate, context.
All materials and fixtures proposed for the exterior must be noted on the elevations drawings. An existing and a proposed elevation drawing of each
facade affected by the proposed work is required.

4. MATERIALS SPECIFICATIONS

General description of materials and manufactured items proposed for incorporation in the work of the project. This information may be included on your

design drawings.

5. PHOTOGRAPHS

a. Clearly labeled photographic prints of each facade of existing resource, including details of the affected portions. All labels should be placed on the
front of photographs.

b. Clearly label photographic prints of the resource as viewed from the public right-of-way and of the adjoining properties. All labels should be placed on
the front of photographs.

6. TREE SURVEY

If you are proposing construction adjacent to or within the dripline of any tree 6" or larger in diameter (at approximately 4 feet above the ground), you

must file an accurate tree survey identifying the size, location, and species of each tree of at least that dimension.

7. ADDRESSES OF ADJACENT AND CONFRONTING PROPERTY OWNERS

For ALL projects, provide an accurate list of adjacent and confronting property owners (not tenants), including names, addresses, and zip codes. This list

should include the owners of all lots or parcels which adjoin the parcel in question, as well as the owner(s) of lots) or parcel(s) which lie directly across

the street/highway from the parcel in question. You can obtain this information from the Department of Assessments and Taxation, 51 Monroe Street,

Rockville, (301/279-1355(.

PLEASE PRINT (IN BLUE OR BLACK INK) OR TYPE THIS INFORMATION ON THE FOLLOWING PAGE.

PLEASE STAY WITHIN THE GUIDES OF THE TEMPLATE, AS THIS WILL BE PHOTOCOPIED DIRECTLY ONTO MAILING LABELS.



H-C

MONTGOMERY COUNTY HISTORIC PRESERVATION COMMISSION
STAFF REPORT

Address: 7391 Buffalo Avenue, Takoma Park Meeting Date: 3/26/08

Applicant: Jeffrey Kohn (Claire McLane, Agent) Report Date: 3/19/08

Resource: Non-Contributing Resource Public Notice: 3/12/08
Takoma Park Historic District

Review: HAWP Tax Credit: None

Case Number: 37/03-08M Staff: Anne Fothergill

PROPOSAL: Deck expansion and stairs, screened porch construction, and basement window
installation

STAFF RECOMMENDATION

Staff is recommending that the HPC approve the HAWP application.

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

SIGNIFICANCE: Non-Contributing Resource in the Takoma Park Historic District
DATE: c. 2000

PROPOSAL

The applicant is proposing to:
• Expand the rear wood deck to a full width wood deck with spiral stairs to grade

Construct a rear screened porch below the deck (basement level)

Install a basement-level window on the right side of the house

APPLICABLE GUIDELINES

When reviewing alterations and new construction within the Takoma Park Historic District several
documents are to be utilized as guidelines to assist the Commission in developing their decision. These
documents include the historic preservation review guidelines in the approved and adopted amendment for
the Takoma Park Historic District (Guidelines), Montgomery County Code Chapter 24A (Chapter 24A),
and the Secretary of the Interior's Standards for Rehabilitation (Standards). The pertinent information in
these documents is outlined below.

Takoma Park Historic District

According to the Takoma Park Guidelines, Non-Contributing Resources in the Takoma Park Historic
District are "either buildings that are of little or no architectural and historical significance to the historic
district or are newer buildings that have been constructed outside of the district's primary periods of

a



historical importance. These types of resources should receive the most lenient level of design review."

The Guidelines also state: "Most alterations and additions to Non-Contributing Resources should be
approved as a matter of course. The only exceptions would be major additions and alterations to the scale
and massing of non-Contributing Resources which affect the surrounding streetscape and/or landscape and
could impair the character of the historic district as a whole."

Montgomery County Code, Chapter 2"

A HAWP permit should be issued if the Commission finds that:

1. The proposal will not substantially alter the exterior features of a historic site or historic resource
within a historic district.

2. The proposal is compatible in character and nature with the historical archaeological, architectural
or cultural features of the historic site or the historic district in which a historic resource is located
and would not be detrimental thereto of to the achievement of the purposes of this chapter.

In the case of an application for work on a historic resource located within a historic district, the
Commission shall be lenient in its judgment of plans for structures of little historical or design significance
or for plans involving new construction, unless such plans would seriously impair the historic or
architectural value surrounding historic resources or would impair the character of the historic district.

Secretary of the Interior's Standards for Rehabilitation:

#9: New additions, exterior alterations, or related new construction shall not destroy historic
materials that characterize the property. The new work shall be differentiated from the old
and shall be compatible with the massing, size, scale, and architectural features to protect
the historic integrity of the property and its environment.

STAFF DISCUSSION

This house is a Non-Contributing Resource in the Takoma Park Historic District, and therefore it receives
the most lenient level of design review. The HPC considers the impact of major additions and alterations
to the scale and massing of Non-Contributing Resources, but other changes to a Non-Contributing resource
"should be approved as a matter of course." All of these changes are at the rear and basement level of this
house and they will not have an adverse impact on the historic district. Staff recommends approval.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends that the Commission approve the HAWP application as being consistent with Chapter
24A-8 (b) 2:

The proposal is compatible in character and nature with the historical, archeological, architectural or
cultural features of the historic site or the historic district in which an historic resource is located and would
not be detrimental thereto or to the achievement of the purposes of this chapter,

and with the Secretary of the Interior's Standards for Rehabilitation,

and with the general condition applicable to all Historic Area Work Permits that the applicant will
present 3 permit sets of drawings to HPC staff for review and stamping prior to submission for
permits (if applicable).

U



CLAIRE McLANE
RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS

4405 WALSH STREET . CHEVY CHASE, MD 20815
t 301 654.2820 f 301 654.5262 c 301404. 2820

clairemclane@aol.com

March 5, 2008

Anne Fothergill
Historic Preservation Commission
M-NCPPC

RE: 7391 Bufalo Avenue
Takoma Park, MD 20912

Dear Anne,

Thank you for taking time to talk with me on the phone yesterday about the above-referenced
project. I am including some additional information that the owner would like you to consider before the
hearing on March 26h. In addition to the new egress window and accompanying window well (necessary
to satisfy the RLU requirements for his parent's living space), the new bathroom window for light and
ventilation, and stairs from the first floor deck, the owners are interested in adding a screened porch under
the (enlarged) first floor deck with a spiral staircase from the deck to the yard below. Finally, there is an
area under the existing front porch that could be used for storage if a new exterior door could be added.
This door would only be visible from the rear of the house.

I am enclosing sketches of the existing and proposed right side and rear elevations of the house, as
well as floor plans to show the proposed layout of the interior rooms. Please let me know if you require
photographs or other information.

You may reach the owners directly, of course, but I would be please to respond to any questions.
The owners' contact information is:

Susan Mattheisen
Jeff Kohn
7391 Buffalo Avenue
Takoma Park, MD 20912

Phone: (202) 494-8473 (cell - Jeff)
(202) 494-8402 (cell — Sue)

ieffandsue@starpower.net

Again, thank you for your assistance. I look forward to staying in touch.

,/ 'r «ice ~~~



Af50u+c, wm~"4 .

fhll~ 11 -7-0 (1 ~-o - -

IL

r-~ 4~ 4, -

Receivery

MAR 4 2008
Dop f off

f ~~ SorviCes

-~- er
g

-r 

f,..j yy I ~`~ v 44~••- 1 Kj p,(- 

E

<4U44y,
C 
*

3,ol 4-0 " (e,4t:~

ok, t - ~~ ~4~ -
aP,-4¢t~h

~ ~' r' A-P) .lam r-, pow-.—rY 4 & ° -.~







~_ ~ `~~
r

--- _ lJ 
)i



Copyright: 2008
CLAIRE McLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street -
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
361.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

LANOTECH ASSOCIATES INC
1 0260 OLD COLUMBIA ROAD SUITE J
COLUMBIA, MARYLAND 211346-1721.

PHONE: 4113-290-8099 TOLL FREE: 888-290-1920
FAX: 41 0-290-8299 TOLL FREE BEIB-290-1 922

O :.
_ -. gfavot

~ ddvawa

LL
LL

m

y

o~a,h+n0

1-56.5

~4 2 Story
fraate

.A1114hJ W AL

S 83a 18' 30" W

Lot 31 
\iV

.4 S.o.

PLot 30
8744 Sq. Ft.
(record plat)

---__- _- 224.18 '

Part of Lot 7 I
_ 

1

I

Scope of Work:
1. Finish existing unfinished basement space
2. Route ductwork from existing HVAC system as necessary to serve new rooms
3. Locate gas supply for future manufactured gas fireplace
4. Frame for future residential elevator
QS Include new kitchen, bathroom, bedroom, living areas, recreation room as

per plan
6. Install all new appliances, fixtures, cabinets
7. Flooring as specified by owner- engineered wood and ceramic the
® New windows as specified to provide egress from new bedroom; provide

window well as necessary
Q9 modify existing first floor deck to include new stairs to yard W17ifit~t~ o I S ✓~ ~ a'
10. prepare 1st floor bathroom to accommo a-fe future elevator, relocate washer"

and dryer to 2nd floor
/ 11. Install shower in 1 st floor bathroom

12. install pocket doors between dining room and existing music room
13. install door and lighting beneath existing front porch for new storage room

/ 1®. install new terrace and steps to backyard as specified by owner

Location Survey of: LOT: 30 BLOCK: 76

#7391 Buffalo Avenue PLAT BK: 8 PLAT"#: 633

T.P.L.& T. Company's

Subdivision of

Takoma Park
Montgomery Co., MD

DATE: 1-22-08 SCALE: 1"=40'

CASE NUMBER: 080002

FILE NUMBER: LT-2080072

~

11

~ NOTES:
A. ~• ,t 1. This plat is of benefit to a consumer only insofar as it is required by a tender or a title insurance company

or its agent in connection with contemplated transfer, financing or re-finandng.
ALIr~ 2. This plat is not to be relied upon for the establishment or location of fences, garages, buildings or other

' I ••d T existing or future improvements.
C'a 

J~o 

E 3. This'plat does not provide for the accurate identification of property boundary lines, but such identification
~t may not be required for the transfer of title or securing financing or re-financing.%~.,~'g«i,)yr„rR 4. Property line survey recommended to determine the exact location of Improvements and/or encroachments, if any.

L 
 

6. This plats not to be used for the Issuance of permits.
and/or 

No title report 
furnish amend/or imposed by law.

CERTIFICATION : I hereby certify that the position of the significant visible Improvements on the above described property
has been carefully established in compliance with the "Minimum Standards of Practice" for the State of Maryland.

GRADEN A. ROGERS -- M.a ROP. L.S. IIC. NO. f 19

a

Designers Notes:
1. Claire McLane, designer, is the copyright holder of these drawings. All

drawings are copyright protected and may not be copied, sold or otherwise
used by any party without the consent of the designer.

2. Drawings are provided to illustrate design intent only. The designer is not
responsible for any errors or omissions, or unforeseen conditions.

3. The designer accepts no responsibility or liability for work performed by others
including any construction, whether executed by a licensed contractor or
not.

4. Modification to the proposed design shall be by consent of the designer only.
5. Any revision to these plans by an unauthorized party is strictly prohibited.
6. The general contractor shall be responsible for checking and verifying all

conditions and measurements before starting work and during construction.
7. The contractor will be responsible for meeting all applicable National and

local building code requirements including IRC and/or BOCA, whether
illustrated in these drawings or not.

8. These drawings were prepared for the property located at the site indicated,
according to its specific conditions at the time of preparations of the
documents. They may not be used or modified for use for any other property.
To do so is a copyright infringement and could be a safety hazard.

9. Drawings may not convey with the property without consent of the designer.
10. This set of drawings includes r s.pageS /. it i~ ,. 

,' , i?

REVISEDlY 7000i

// P/~h i,'% 'v~lltl

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

REVISED

All construction shall be in accordance
w/International Residential Code 2003
(IRC 2003( and all other applicable
national and/or local building codes,
per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE:~~10/79Do

Q 
PLAN: GiI~G
FLOOR:
SCALE: 1/4" = f'0 / //



Residential Construction Notes (Contractor to adhere to IRC 2003 and any other applicable national/local building wiles for
construction, as well as any manufacturer's installation specifications for pre-fabricated/pm-engineered lumber or materials including
fireboxes, appliances, fixtures, etc). Additional construction notes may apply according to local jurisdiction requirements.

1. Soil bearing shall be in conformance with IRC 2003, The bottom of conerele footings shall be min. 2'6" below grade.
2. Design live loads shall be:

• Attics (limited storage) 20 psi
• Dwelling unit 40 psi
• Sleeping rooms 30 psi
• Balconies (exterior) 60 psi
• Garage 50 psi
• Decks 40 psi
• Stairs 40 psi

3. Bathrooms without windows shall be vented to outside of building
4. Habitable rooms, except kitchens, shalt have ceilings no less than 7'6" for at least 50% of the area. Not more hmn 50% of

the room may have a sloped ceiling less than 7'6" in height with not portion of the room Less than 5 it in In.
5. Glass doors, tub and shower enclosures, skylights, and side glass panels shall have safety glass.
6. Sleeping rooms shalt have at least one egress window. Windows shall have a max sill ht of44" above the finished floor.

Egress windows shall have a min. 5 sq It open area. Min clear width of 20" and min In of 22"
7. Stairways shall have a min 6'8" clear head room. Minimum tread shall be 10", max riser 7 3/:', min width 36'
8. Open sides of stairs. Porches, balconies, raised floor surfaces and retaining walls shall have guardrail not less than 36" ht

Spacing between pickets less than 4". Guardrail on open side of stairs not less than 34" hL Guardrail on retaining wall
min 36" ht with pickets less than 4" apart. Bottom rail of stair miling shall be constructed to prevent 3" diameter ball from
passing between rail and stair tread. Handmils shall have min ht of 30", max ht of 38" measured from the nosing of the
treads.

9. Interconnected smoke detectors on each level and in each bedroom. Detectors shall be hardwired with battery back up
10. All untreated lumber shall be min 8" above finished grade. All wood in contact with soil or masonry foundation to be

presuure-treated—ACQ treated SYP or equivalent All fasteners used with ACQ treated lumber will meet ASTM
Standard A153 and A653, class 185.

11, All flaming lumber to SPF #2 unless otherwise indicated.
12. Radon venting to be installed as per IRC 2003
13. Lot drainage to comply with local and national codes
14. Sill plates on top of foundation walls shall be secured with min %z" anchor bolts or approved stmps (ja 6'0" o.c. max, 7"

into concrete and 15" into grout filled masonry, max 12" from each comer
15. Foundation walls shall extend min 6' above finished grade adjacent to (he foundation walls at all points
16. Masonry chimneys located within the exterior walls shall have min. air space clearance to combustibles of 2". The air

space shall not be filled, except to provide fire stopping.

Stmctuml Notes:
LIVE LOADS

• Roof 30 psf
• Floor 40 psf
• Deck 40psf

FOUNDATION — Bottoms of all footings shall beat least 2'6" below finished grade. Walt footing shall be min. 8" deep and project
min. 4" beyond each face of mall. Footings shall be reinforced with 3 #5 steel bars.
REINFORCING STEEL —All reinforcing steel shall conform to ASTM-A615, Grade 60.
SLABS ON GRADE—shall be 4" thick, reinforced with 6x6, W1.4xWL4 (6x6.10/10) W WM. Lap mesh 6" in each direction.
Provide control joints in slabs on grade at 15'0" o.c. max. Interior slabs shall be laid on a layer of 6 mil polyethylene over 4" washed
gravel.

Other design critedir
• Roof and flour dead load 10 lbs/sf
• Seismic design category B
e Termite damage subjectivity—heavy
• Winter design temperature-18 degrees F
• Subjectivity to damage from weather — heavy
• Subjectivity to decay — moderate

Wind speed-90 mph
• Frost line depth-24"

Flood hazard—yes
Concrete: 3000 psi compression strength in 28 days
Subfloors: 3/," APA subfloor/underlayment rated, tongue and groove, glued and nailed to joists
Roof sheathing: Yr" OSB with spacers
Roofing: min. 215 lb per square asphalt shingles (or other equal) over 15 lb felt

Ala
I<{I%r*) ~1G~l9brl Wt{Mi

fsor"7 *f ~' +lA~t rs~~

WIv 5 i5 GrY L^v C,i7 W r1~.40 _17. ML-

Copyright: 2008
CLAIRE MCLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

0
M

a

N

REVISED ~2I2~8

All construction shallbe in accordance
w/Intemational Residential Code 2003
(IRC 2003( and all other applicable and
prevailing national and/or local building
codes, per the Jurisdiction of this site.

DATE:

PLAN:L Fi✓G G'?I'f 6

SCALE: Yd' = 7'0 
G 0- If



419'L.- iAA' e( l o 

,

ow aJlr~pprJ 9m, vvmLr-

fl~,~ ta+k.4,*4~g Parttt~' ̀ ht•;t(~.,~TR-

Copyright: 2006
CLAIRE McLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

REVISED ~7 I

All construction shall be in accordance
w/International Residential Code 2003
)IRC 2003) and all other applicable and
prevailing national and/or local building
codes, per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE:
PLAN:jll}.

FLOOR:

SCALE: 1/4" = 1'0 
~ 
~~~



Kiictut,

41

C'
- 

—4

1 P,~

_... .q'~~ :. ..............., .._... ... -'.__...._. it II _...._ .._ _. _.. _.._. ~ __.- _. ~ _.._ ,. _. _. ....._....___-....

ID' 1t,
f ~_ - . - ~~ . ~ h'~G.Gt.• P7~iq~'~ -~~~.. 

~.i- 21~ IU fKvr)h~'v 't7a1A6D "'~ Ilv~~ I

i i ~ ~ 

i 

d1:hW 7rov14 y1~t;9a%+' ~. Io Ao.c.

I ! j
it I I

li: tiZ J

f! i --

! t 1 I

/~ yfd< 1

. VN lt$is, 14-VIrA

I

gF,trv6~s Cvl rt~4J ~(G.,G,v coLuMn16

._.. ... .. 1. r

131- 14PA4-0 

14"'A M~

9f-Go,
M. tIA-

4. Arw-

Q.(r ie tk%(4v
I SfnYk6r4d,4 (fl~r/'v

F~~"Y./A✓ I~~°G~

M

Copyright: 2008
CLAIRE McLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

3b xs,'o Ari?Jq

MIDhPulo-Lgt~IGy 
9, ( ~JVJInItYt1F 

MI~3lt`~ ~ 4%MUrI}I j +. r n is2 ~1Pt A

4, e-

-

Sit

i

.~

i

2 p

REVISED

All construction shall be in accordance
w/International Residential Code 2003
(IRC 2003{ and all other applicable and
prevailing national and/or local building
codes, per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE:
PLAN 
FLOOR:
SCALE: Y<" = 1'0 ~; ~~



tca4%4 fl pr"*

tnuano-2ouw 

li ur1&dj~

.. c~ 

i 

Ylrullt~ Il_tlb't1

Qa~~ux

blJlxlA (1~,t•{ Oldtxlt~.! _ .._,'rahs~

f----lo-`-{r---~

PUY,

well Gyi (wo, FUW

V if t:i~nctmat~i ~3 
sj 

_' _

tWLrt i l~ L—i—I i

MMAMA 4

Wa

Ht N'& '%'Pfart

V"

coPydyhr. zoos
CLAIRE McLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.6544820 0/ 301.404.2820 c

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
In any manner without the knowledge

0
M

0
a

REVISED)

All construction shall be in accordance
w/Intemational Residential Code 2003
)IRC 2003) and all other applicable
national and/or local building codes,
per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE: 1✓ ! S
PLAN: / f /✓,)d,
FLOOR: / VPZ
SCALE: 1/4" = 1'0 

5 o' /I



fN~~✓✓i~lN--°( nr/~~i't~it%i'r~i ( ~f1 V%'f~,C

Mot,: ~ vWv''7~ ~14 - 1JD~ `'~1fix~1fl~ WV 61Qaq

loo i i,I < j R4PRo1~ ('0 Ir'i. Vr~OEi ~tl>,)oits!~

IV

17 ti

VP
v A U i1 mV~ip '7E1'a.,M

1

i

y - M 
S 

c'

Copyright: 2006 -- -
CLAIRE McLANE _

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC -
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used -
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

REVISED G

All construction shall be in accordance
w/International Residential Code 2003
(IRC20D3) and all other applicable
national and/or local building codes,
per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE: I
PLAN: lIr✓lr 411461&!"!
FLOOR:
SCALE: 1/4" = 1'0



Residential Construction Notes (Contractor to adhere to IRC 2003 and any other applicable national/local building codes for
construction, m wail as any manufacturer's installation specifications for pre-f ibricamd/pre-engineered lumber or materials including
fireboxes, appliances, fixtures, etc). Additional construction notes may apply according to local jurisdiction requirements.

1. Soil bearing shall be in conformance with IRC 2003, The bottom of concrete footings shall be min. 2'6" below grade.
2. Design live loads shall be:

• Attics (invited storage) 20 psi
• Dwelling unit 40 psi
• Sleeping moms 30 psi
• Balconies (exterior) 60 psi
• Garage 50 psi
• Decks 40 psi

Stairs 40 psi
3. Bathrooms without windows shall be vented to outside of building
4. Habitable rooms, except kitchens, shall have ceilings no less than T6" for at least 50% of the area. Not more htan 50% of

the room may have a sloped ceiling less than 7'6" in height with not portion of the room less than 5 It in ht.
5. Glass doors, tub and shower enclosures, skylights, and side glass panels shall have safety glass.
6. Sleeping rooms shall have at least one egress window. Windows shall have a max sill ht of 44" above the finished floor.

Egress windows shall have a min. 5 sq R open area Min clear width of 20" and min ht of 22"
7. Stairways shall have amin 6'8" clear head room. Minimum tread shall be 10", max riser 7%", min width 36"
8. Open sides of stairs. Porches, balconies, raised floor surfaces and retaining walls shall have guardrail not less than 36" ht.

Spacing between pickets less than 4". Guardrail on open side of stairs not less than 34" ht. Guardmil on retaining wall
min 36" ht with pickets less than 4" apart. Bottom rail of stair railing shall be constructed to prevent 3" diameter ball from
passing between mil and stair tread. Himdmils shall have min In of 30", max In of 38" measured from the nosing of the
treads.

9. interconnected smoke detectors on each level and in each bedroom. Detectors shall be hardwired with battery back up
10. All untreated lumber shall be min 8" above finished grade. All wood in contact with soil or masonry foundation to be

presuure-treated—ACQ treated SYP or equivalent, All fasteners used with ACQ treated lumber will meet ASTM
Standard At 53 and A653, class 185.

11. All framing lumber to SPF lit unless otherwise indicated.
12. Radon venting to be installed as per IRC 2003
13. Lot drainage to comply with local and national codes
14. Sill plates on top of foundation walls shall be secured with min %z " anchor bolts or approved straps Q 6'0" o.c. max, 7"

into concrete and IS" into grout filled masonry, max 12" from each comer
15. Foundation walls shall extend min 6" above finished grade adjacent to the foundation walls at all points
16. Masonry chimneys located within the exterior walls shall have min. air space clearance to combustibles of 2". The air

space shall not be filled, except to provide fire stopping.

No

I

~Af~~nph IhYvnro Sla,;.w r-tJO"i~~ I ~

fowl tl ~t

IrI~fIM4 Mln~ /1' GmiG.yvkYb 6VC v 
sG Hut. N bK Vt 0m, ?nfi,ft4~, , Wq

N

Copyright: 2008 
_.. _ _ .... _. . .

CLAIRE McLANE
RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

- - These drawings may not be copied, and
/~,,~n,' designs depicted may not be used

in any manner 
and express permission 

ut the 
Iof Claire McLane.

Stair Notes
Min. tread width 36';Min. tread depth 11"
Max riser height 8"
Provide railing min. 36" ht
Pickets max 4" o.c. apart
Bottom halt Max 3" above step

w. .. _._
7

,rn\n\t0 it Aad"a 461,E 1A],1nu1 AZ, etaw
I



e

INTERIOR FINISH SCHEDULE
Ceilings and Walls: All interior wall finishes to include K" Gypsum wallboard on wall; except flathmoms(ase green board). Prime
and paint two (2) coats—color selected by miner.
Mlllwork/rrimr Minch existing as closely a possible in all rrorna
Floors: Provide DunsRock subiloor in tiled areas; o(herwise, hardwood to match existing or orb" wood m specified by owner

37LEWORK:
Wails and floors shall be installed acwNingto panem designedandrorscleeled byowner. Quamilimspecifiedmprarntapprmimme
square rootage or area lobe covered and do nor include extra for cutting. Tde instWler to specify odditiorel wre orbull nose pimm,
as needed.

ROOM notes:

Vestibule/ stair landing: wood floor to match existing stairs

Study: wood floor as specified by owner, built-in desks and bookcases by others

Living room: wood floor as specified by owner
Prepare for future gas fireplace as nec. —gas supply, vent to outside

Dining Room: wood floor as specified by owner

Kitchen: wood floor to match other living areas

Bathroom; radiant floor under ceramic the selected by owner, install as per design by designer and owner
Approx. 50 sf floor tile, 20 sf wainscot tile (36" ht behind toilet and backsplash), 15 sf shower
floor tile, 115 sf shower wall tile IS it ht) — exact quantities TBD on site and by design

48" vanity cabinet, countenop with integral sink or under-mount sink — owner to specify
One-piece toilet — recommend Kohler Rialto or Kohler San Raphael
Custom shower— file all surfaces, include 14x18 niche at 48-inch ht for incidentals (see plan)

Shower surround tiled to 8-ft In.
Sloped shower pan beginning level w/bat rmin floor—no threshold, min 36" opening

(bandi-capped accessible)
Provide safety but in shower and adjacent to toilet as specified by owner

Bedroom: min 36"-wide door to hall and bathroom for handi-capped accessibility
Prepare.floor for carpet and padding as specified by owner and installed by others

Recreation Room: concrete floor to be painted (2 mats epoxy paint) or tiled as specified by owner
Mirrored closet doors; other miaom as specified by owner— installed by others

Storage: concrete floor to be painted (2 coats epoxy paint)

r

1

rIVaUr( '

N

LI
1'

Wrt,L 6Bdtvk ~ I

i d

j I

I_ .
"~ ~ 'fifiP7[29otr(

-0

i I 9rs
1!

i

4~1~W fl4rnxl f N (1 /kk Grnsn llrs t Mt0ut4v t tic4t (2fpxi oc~ w a , 500V, f+~-" ~p khnut ~r l 12

WWIV OEAviN:t WAK i.`~ 4141-tnl -tN 04tr* .WNW( Olorv-1ho4 - Wo

~tbryJ yls$4N„'G. Cl,~(f~,14 f~' A111;v~>

1 

_ ----------
7

_ Y_ 

Lava~¢krC bas's. tr
b'(10f1 lG,{,N fllhlA /MT!Ltr

f , v

r!ll ,/% ~iiu94 taarod

QIGa'(bC( ~Fbi— 
yru~igp..

1,1040 Itiolow
hlu @ 94.• tY4.

e:o 5' hit, lc x'33/lb

el"1414z V- P&4;$

I '

-4 410tV
i

m̂

PLUMBING NOTES:
Plumber to be responsible for sizing and locating pipes and vents as necessary
Designer and/or Owner to select all fixtures Inc. bathtubs, toilets, sinks, faucets, etc.
Owner to supply all fixtures; Contractor to install unless otherwise specified by contract

HVAC Notes:
All existing HVAC systems to remain
HVAC mechanic/subcontractor to determine best placement of new/addiftonal units and associated ductwork
HVAC for addtfion(s) to be extension of existing with supplemental zone(s) added as needed in some rooms
Zones to be divided between floors, If possible
Ancillary heat pump/air conditioning unfl(s) may be added in Individual rooms

$A'(471oYk4 ( *'futh ̀v) o- f, -0✓ (/gAj q T11d.>( kq h1frIV&

M

_F
_ t _ 1:92oVloFilrti( +yti,.,l~ f~ r

--
- ('✓u1dedv~ A 

tn(rr-~m----Ih o

j I

s -~. WnlTlf tP

1 , 'Didf lk%tl ~~'ltirtt~

try 
lu'{o

4 

~fltir) tdt lost) ~'ro"Ie5Lbof ow5).

41v- 0" it(-
~,o yV6 X V64

~r~f(AVyL W1hinah Ui14D1nrb hMNA) W6Yf0AN1srtt)'bLt Q A'S WOVA) ~i RAMN wl"110 6Da4 

W W' ~ r 1~s1.J4alf lrl Vi'1•,h, w }i l~~i fiiliJl7 wf 6l ly wli t td'i ~,'Adi ~1 7i/tlr/r~"t!%

Copyright: 2008
CLAIRE McLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

I

i

El

REVISED

All construction shall be in accordance
w/intemational Residential Code 2003
(IRC 2003) and all other applicable
national and/or local building codes,
per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE: ail
PLAN: jlr f~1un;;,
FLOOR:
SCALE: 1/4" = 1'0



ELECTRICAL KEY
Electrician to be responsible for providing proper power (AMPS) and Circuits
& locating all wiring and circuit box(es) as appropriate. All work shall be to current prevailing electrical code

Wall switch 0 .
Wall switch with dimmer

Ceiling fixture
Recessed ceiling fixture i \
Ceiling fixture with tan 

Q
Wall fixture

Fluorescent fixture --~.—/

Wall outlet
Wall outlet (major appliance) Q'
Wall outlet with GFC (,6N

Cable TV
Telephone/modem connection
Speakers locate as per owner

PLUMBING NOTES:
Plumber to be responsible for sizing and locating pipes and vents as necessary
Designer and/or Owner to select all fixtures Inc. bathtubs, toilets, sinks, faucets, etc.
Owner to supply alt fixtures: Contractor to install unless otherwise specified by contract

HVAC Notes:
All existing HVAC systems to remain
HVAC mechanic/subcontractor to determine best placement of new/addBional units (if necessary) and
associated ductwork
HVAC for addition(s) to be extension of existing with supplemental zone(s) added as needed in some rooms
Zones to be divided between floors, if possible
Ancillary heat pump/air conditioning un'rl(s) may be added in individual rooms

3 Ir

~ i l

0 —d; U- 0801-,-~F~,

CONSULT FACTORY

IF LARGER
FINISHED 

52" 
lll~~~

SHAFT (46-1/2" MIN

O
MAXIMUM 381/2" 91/2"2 PLATFORM 

(34" MIN.)
51/8" .' 43/6"

to i

I~

— 37"
CLEAR INSIDE

o WIDTH -(—

z za -

z w

In

Z= -
LL xn a 33„ cn

EMI LOCK

iV 
- i 

`n'---------------2 - — -------- - O
3

STAT ON

5" ' 36" 11" -

STANDARD HOISTWAY PLAN
SCALE - 1/2" =1'

NOTE: ALL DIMENSIONS ARE APPROXIMATE

oRnxm: GiEG(Ep:

G.P. I M.C. RTIM706

NOTES:

O1 IF PLATFORM SIZE IS REDUCED, THEN THE BLOCKING IS TO BE
POSITIONED SUCH THAT IT IS CENTERED ON THE PLATFORM.
(PLATFORM DEPTH /2)+2" = CENTERLINE OF RAIL BLOCKING
OFF OF INSIDE FRONT WALL. (MIN. 27" DIMENSION)

2O CAR TO WALL (CTW) DIMENSION IS W MIN. WiTH WALL MOUNT

PHONE AND 4" MIN. WITH PHONE BOX

Q HOISTWAY DOORS AND FRAMES TO BE INSTALLED IN A 2"x 4"
WALL CONSTRUCTION OR RECESSED INTO A DEEPER WALL
CONSTRUCTION TO EQUATE TO A 2" x 4" WALL.
THIS IS REQUIRED TO COMPLY WITH 3" x 5" RULE.

® HOISTWAY DOORS TO BE SOLID CORE (BY OTHERS.)

O5 CLEAR CAB DIMENSIONS BASED ON A 3/4" FLAT WALL
CAB DESIGN. PICTURE FRAME AND FRAME / PANEL CABS -
REDUCE CLEAR INSIDE WIDTH BY 1-1/2" AND CLEAR INSIDE
DEPTH BY 3/4".

IVERESIDENTIAL20
CRAWFORDVILLE, FL

CRAWF DENIAL , FL

ELEVATORS
32327

ResidentialElavators.com

Elevating your standard of living 1-800-832-2004

3RnME

950#, RH RAIL, IN-LINE OPENING,
DR4N9O MEER

ACCORDION GATE, 12 SQ. FT. HYD HP1 A 12

-- -Copyright.. zoo-a
CLAIRE McLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 C

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

REVISED 
JP4106

All construction shall be in accordance
w/International Residential Code 2003
(IRC 2003) and all other applicable
national and/or local building codes,
per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE: yi 1;710l '~" '

,PLAN:

FLOOR:

SCALE: 1/4" = I'D ~r ~/



ywv 610 ~/OIAV

9AG Ik'1 A19r. Wft-

~w( io!Awt,

-ff 

L--- —id't{i1caw\ ~'lkNu<✓(~J.+A. ~,.-Uq~l1 Qame.__.~ _A1tUl~=-- - ~r%OAK-- --....:--4krlid (-.... - -=1 ----.__ -- 

' i•

I
i I

-'U14wiS 1k9*1 __... __.. v._<.. _._ I~46rlTs*(-.i...-~h✓nl9PkGwa ~i E1Pf4i(oontfJaxC<1 .. :

L---.___ ___......'j71+~{"'ti't1ao+A _ ___ .~.__:/_.._. ._ ..__i~Kfi~Y:%h\._.._.__ _.._.. ~_/._. -.._......._$t~~.Troa. _.- ~._.C_ _ .__ .. _~yf~jpo,^k~1.... __.._. _~ ((%~fr~ ~ .. ___ G~vYyr3^~b.-~G•r-m~..''~- t~~-~_

f.Q{{yytr/rnt.tw ~L__._._..~.Jfl✓;,_----__--~'-iA'~~a4Zlli_'t/__.. _ ~

.fu why.' rolrnri 417 0109 WA

jI & n F I%i[`O

i .._(~•(~., .. ~L.lFi[,~r11~lr.~.✓_~(r~1difi'rfK~ -̀ ~__..:__.___...~,19✓.._._-_- .-_'`

a 3a,~4~aFl

- f Utz,- -*140A

Copyright: 20b6
.._ 

_ -. _.... . -...

CLAIRE McLANE
RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, Jnq
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.280 c

These drawings may not be. copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

REVISED Y

All construction shall be in accordance
w/international Residential Code 2003
tIRC 20031 and all other applicable
national and/or local building codes,
per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE:

PLAN:
FLOOR:
SCALE: 1/4" = 1'0



t PIA~tb rij Q. yut.- Gilksrli~-/ :mss'—•

CN Oly.~o^(Kl✓

13 yF (y~(v 4uof th 9 ~1 ^~ n 7.0 4F 17-y z.

lkn?J Ibo~F ~tic,J NtoiZr.U7 ~

wo 1~~P~rnJi> p7uv*t9 — --r—
QfAx-(1 ~i" (~•.

A

i M jj;l - i I

- 8
'

I .

m1Ilk I
.

L _ ~ .~--__:___•--___ __.,1 J10 : - _ . -..fit

(iP6Jtn~G f Gj%{~t~i _~ de~ci: oA s~ pjwJ CJ
(t~

M'l(''F'LQ 104 Xi2 p '(VP Gi1i1i q(GJWYKI OV41 k0 IA1. i"ItIM Mli

1 I

IL y41' y1Wv of by A(VIo l'af p( -lop or

~" N ~?~rlv n~rt~-1 
y4^' 9itiw,~~,r~zr'.~• ~

7. 476,, til~~ nmM~ mnr ,rd~~- j
,IG° PkGUt1Gt A1ot+ y19(v ~K ~14Y'~ (o vrQti 2~''

(2-1 (l (10 (5) CG> C7~ r C o)
ALL (ovi>~gtk yl~IKI'in EAl?Xl4 8(001 wfl V.j—

VJAk, Ni- f IF112vdXlvo u1~u Ca4b 

"vow, ,tit ovu, girt k"51

U16 lv r A'kR f 7A 4 wk v vrttnt. 6*it'

S4" Cd~rAV,}ur.~WL- Gr1h, tf - A 7 t4x 

~po~vlj 

X17 

/

!~lkt>C

y 

~*It1.

'l, ~lO
u,,„„j fv.'✓ QJ~i'S(/ ~,'~f i4(~`~~~: A"rq. (LiIY (,drLx{;~ ̀~6+%~+. r% ~ lQ'14 ~~ (Nt' ~r~,>r1~r~:r~..-  

r 
- -  - .

~^''~ 
t'%? ~  ~r' (AtjA1~t/ rm~i¢r ~sJ. X01 In'~ .~1J'~ti1Y,~ C2% IY` (.~F/✓ %Ptt7/7 .

j

i

I

Copyright•. 2008
CLAIRE McLANE

RESIDENTIAL CONCEPTS, INC
4405 Walsh Street
Chevy Chase, MD 20815
301.654-2820 a/ 301.404.2820 c

These drawings may not be copied, and
designs depicted may not be used
in any manner without the knowledge
and express permission of Claire McLane.

0

a°

REVISED ~J

All construction shall be in accordance
w/international Residential Code 2003
IIRC 2003) and all other applicable
national and/or local building codes,
per the jurisdiction of this site.

DATE

PLAN
FLOOR

SCALE: 1/4" = IT 
// PY, //


